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May 2011  

May promises to be a 

busy month for COPC 
 

 Chaplain Jim Crowley has been 

assisting the Eugene Police 

Department, the Lane County 

Sheriff’s Office, the Oregon State 

Fire Marshall’s Office and 

numerous other agencies by 

responding as an Oregon Chaplain 

Response Team member in 

assisting EPD with the Line Of Duty 

Death of one of their Officers. 

Chaplain Mike Dismore also 

assisted at the LODD service on 

April 29th. Jim and Mike are 

returning to Eugene to assist with 

Critical Incident Stress Debriefings 

on May 3rd. Others will continue to 

assist EPD and the other agencies 

involved in the days to come. 

 

The COPC Auction Dinner will be 

on Friday, May 6th. This is our 

largest annual fundraiser for COPC. 

There is more information in the 

article under News & Events. 

 

COPC will be hosting six 

appreciation lunches and dinners 

in the three counties of Central 

Oregon May 9th through 13th. We 

are hoping to have the assistance 

of local business and restaurants in 

this venture. Here are the dates 

and locations for the events: 

 

● Monday, 5/09 from 11:30 – 

14:00; Jefferson County Sheriff’s 

Office 
● Tuesday, 5/10 from 11:30-14:00; 

Redmond Fire Department  

● Tuesday, 5/10 from 17:00-19:30; 

Deschutes County Sheriff’s Office  

● Wednesday, 5/11 from 17:00-

19:30; Bend Police Department  

● Thursday, 5/12, from 11:00-

13:00; Sunriver Fire Department 

● Friday, 5/13 from 16:00-18:00; 

Prineville Police Department 
 

Trainings -  

Chaplains Jim Crowley and Mike 

Dismore will be teaching a number 

of classes in the next two months. 

The information is listed below: 

 

Individual Crisis Intervention & 

Peer Support Class - 05/16-17, 

0800-1700 hours, at Dispatch 

Training Center Deschutes County, 

Bend, Oregon - Cost $99.00 

 

Stress Management for the Trauma 

Service Provider Class - 05/25-26, 

0800-1700 hours, at Redmond Fire 

& Rescue Training Center - Cost 

$99.00 

 

Pastoral Crisis Intervention Class - 

05/31-06/01, 0800-1700 hours, at 

the Hillsboro Fire & Rescue Station 

#6, 21880 NW Cherry Lane, 

Hillsboro, Oregon - Cost $99.00 

 

Pastoral Crisis Intervention Class - 

06/29-06/30, 0800-1700 hours,  

Bend, Oregon - Cost $99.00 
 

Contact either: 

Chaplain Jim Crowley 

jbcrowley@bendbroadband.com 

541-410-6128 

Chaplain Mike Dismore 

pastordiz@juno.com 

541-788-3364 cell 

 

Or go to the COPC web site at 

www.copchaplain.com and click on 

the information under the Events 

Calendar. Each of the event links 

will have another link to download 

a flyer for the respective training. 

 

May is often a busy month for calls 

and other COPC requests. 

 

 
 

News & Events 
 

 COPC Auction Dinner – The 

Auction Dinner is scheduled for 

Friday, May 6th, 2011 and will be 

held at the Christian Life Center, 

21720 E Hwy 20 in Bend. Auction 

Dinner Information: 5:00 pm Silent 

Auction; 6:30 pm Dinner & Live 

Auction; Dinner Tickets are $25 

per person; a Table Sponsor (for 8 
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people) is $400; and a Corporate 

Sponsor (for 16 people) is $1,000. 

Auction items include: vacations 

trips, golf packages, weekend 

getaways, jewelry, fishing trips, 

dinners, art, photography, and 

more. We will be raffling off a 

Charmglow grill loaded with 

outstanding features: Large multi-

function cook top, lets you sear, 

grill or cook using the two side 

burners. Keep your beverages and 

condiments chilled and in close 

reach with the built-in refrigerator. 

Warming drawer with adjustable 

temperature, keeps foods warm 

while others continuing grilling. 

Overhead lights adjust to 

illuminate cook top. Unique dual-

sliding stainless steel grill covers 

protect the cook top when not in 

use. Raffle tickets are $5/ticket or 

5 tickets/$20 for a chance to win 

this luxury grill. (Winner need not 

be present to win.) 

 

 DCSO Corrections – Chaplains 

Jemes, Dismore, and Crowley 

continue to meet weekly for a 

lunch with the Corrections Family. 

These have proven to be very 

positive opportunities to make 

contact with our Corrections 

Deputies in Deschutes County. 

They are great women and men 

serving our community. 

 COPC Website – The COPC 

website is continuing to be 

upgraded and changed. We would 

encourage as many as can to check 

it out at www.copchaplain.com and 

please give us some input for a 

reevaluation of how we look on the 

web. We have plans for more 

opportunities with the site. 

 COPC Chaplains Training – 

First Tuesday each month at the 

COPC office from 0900-1200 and 

lunch for those who can stay. 

 COPC Board Meeting – Second 

Thursday each month at the COPC 

office from 0830-1000 hours. 

 

Prayer Requests 

The following requests for prayer 

come to us as a request and 

permission to share the 

information with friends of COPC. 

 Pray for COPC Chaplain Lorien 
Petersen as she relocates to North 
Dakota. 

 Please be in prayer for the 
Eugene Police Department and 
Lane County Sheriff’s Office as they 
continue to deal with the aftermath 
of a Line Of Duty Death of EPD 
Officer Chris Kilcullen. 

 First Responders will find the 
strength to ask for HELP when they 
need it. 

 Marriages of our Fire, Law 
Enforcement and Dispatch families. 
Our Chaplains meet weekly with 
officers, firefighters and 
dispatchers that request our 
assistance and prayers for their 
families. 

 Covering of His Grace, Wisdom 
and Protection on our chaplains 
and families.  

 Safety & Protection for all of the 
agencies and Departments that we         
serve in Central Oregon. 

Dispatched Chaplain 
Requests 

Chaplains Wright and Petersen 
assisted BPD and BF&R with a DOA 
04/02 

Chaplains Wright and Petersen 
assisted BF&R with a second DOA 
04/02 

Chaplain Dismore assisted DCSO 
and RF&R with a DOA 04/05 

Chaplain Jemes assisted LPF&R 
and DCSO with a DOA and Death 
Notification 04/06 

Chaplain Dismore assisted RPD 
with a Death Notification 04/07 

Chaplains Jeffery and Petersen 
assisted BPD with a DOA 04/10 

Chaplain Jeffery assisted BPD with 
a Suicide 04/11 

Chaplain Crowley assisted BPD 
with a Death Notification 04/13 

Chaplain Crowley assisted SCMC 
with a Suicide 04/15 

Chaplain Jeffery assisted BPD with 
a Suicide and Death Notification 
04/15 

Chaplain Wright assisted BPD and 
BF&R with a Car Fire and MVA 
04/15 

Chaplain Jemes assisted DCSO with 
a Suicide Death Notification 04/19 

Chaplain Crowley assisted BPD & 
OSP with a Missing Person/Body 
Recovery 04/20 

Chaplain Crowley assisted BF&R 
with a Hospital Transport 04/22 

Chaplain Jeffery assisted BPD with 
a Hospital Transport 04/22 

Chaplain Jemes assisted BPD and 
BF&R with a Suicide 04/27 

Chaplain Petersen assisted BPD 
with a DOA 04/28 

 


